REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION:

I recommend that the Council approve the Mayor’s appointment of Mike Ciark as the next Director
of Transportation for the City of Beloit.

FISCAL NOTE:

e The recommended salary for this position is Grade 31, Step 9, $58,780.80 per year.

e Funding for this type of item was included in the 2014 budget in line item 10-15-1100
{transportation fund).

DISCUSSION:

The search committee interviewed one candidate for this position last week and Mike is highly
recommended by the committee.

Respectfully submitied,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION ~ 8/5/2014 TRANSP







REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION:

[ recommend that the city council approve the bid from Kriz-Davis Electric Company in the

amount of $40,988.00. Funding is available under Electric Systems Division, 53-43-6070 &
53-43-8300.

FISCAL NOTE:

Kriz-Davis Co. $40,988.00
Stanion Wholesale Electric $41,348.00
Solomon Corporation $52.650.00
WESCO $54,077.00

DISCUSSION:

The materials will be used for the Beloit Elementary School and Circle Drive projects.

Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION

TRANSFORMER BID







CITY OF BELOIT

119 North Hersey
Box 567
Beloit, Kansas 67420

The City of Beloit, Kansas, 119 North Hetsey, Box 567, Beloit, Kansas, will be
accepting bids at the office of the City Clerks untik:

TIME: 3:30 PM

DATE: July 30, 2014

Foz the purchase of the following item(s)/ material(s): Electric Transformess Bid L.
032715 ’

All itemns(s)/ material(s) ate to be bid FOB, Beloit, Kansas. This bid is to be
guaranteed for no less than thitty (30) days from the date of bid opening,

All bids submitted in an envelope ate to be prominently marked: Transformer
Bid or 1L-032715
All bids submitted by fax or email will need to have a follow up signed
bid in an envelope and is to be prominently marked:
Electronic Bid or L-032715

All'bids received by the closing date and time will be publicly opened and tead
aloud at the time and date above in the office of the City Cletk, 119 North Hersey,
Beloit, Kansas. ,

All bids must fill out the spec sheet attached or bid will be denied

The City of Beloit, reserves the right to select the best bid, waiver formalities
and reject any 2nd all bids.

For additional information on bid specifications, contact Ronnie Spozleder at
System Operations Department, (785) 738-3781.

For additional information on results of the bid opening, contact the Office of
the City Clerk, (785) 738-3551

Mandy Lomax
Director of Finance / Gity Clerk
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| BID # 1L-032715

General Specifications for all Pad mournt
Transformers _,

1) All tansformers shal be new and shall' } have gocd weldswith
o leaks, geod. paint job with.no rustand the doors will £it
without haviag to be foreed.

2} All transfornvers shall be Dead Front Fior op Feed with bushing
weélls and bushmg well insers. '

- 3) They shall have faur inch spade type low voltage brass

busings
4) They shall be mpw copper wotnd gores fpﬁmﬁ_}? and

Secondary.): .
5) They shill hiave fiew PCB Free Ol (‘?‘P}l‘ﬁ{ orléss) and 2 PCB

Analysis Réport for each transforitier:
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PROPOSAL SHEET
'FOR BID L=~ 032714

1 propose to Suppl} the Gity of Beloit, Kansas with. (13) Single phase 25 Kva Pacdmounts and

(7) Sinle phiise 15 Kva Pad nuenots listed in this bid for & mmlpmhqse fitlce of $40.988.00

this i FOB, 502 B, 12° Strcet, Beloit, Kanisas: 67420:0567.

{ wiiderstanid thit s bid 7 to be guaranteed for no less than fiffeen (15) days from the date

ofbid opening.

BIDDER (NAME UF FIRN), _ Kriz-Davis Company

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE - sam s g =

ADDRESS 232N.3rdSt. _ CITY Salina

STATE_____ KS _ ZIPCODFE____ p7401

TELEPHONE_ (185)827-4497 ____ DATF._ 7242014
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PROPOSAL SHEET
FOR BID L - 032714

Ipropose to supply the City of Beloit, Kansas with (13) Single phase 25 Kva Pad mounts and

‘ (7) Single phase 15 Kva Pad mounts listed in this bid for 2 total purchase price of §

’5‘({ J 5[8 o0 this is FOB, 502 B. 12" Stieet, Beloit, Kansas 67420-0567.

1 understand that this bid is to be guaranteed for nio less than fifteen (15) days from the date

of bid opening.

BIDDER (NAME OFFIRM) ____ BERMIE [VELTH Q\ﬁé@@my holesale

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE, _% 22

ADDRESS /206 £ Z2nd 5% CTY__Aays

STATE _ fawses 7IP CODE__4£ 7428/

TELEPHONE,__$40 - 397~ F 722 DATE. 7/4"/// vl
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PROPOSAL SHEET
'FOR BID L - 032714

1 propose 1o supply the City-of Beloit, Kansas with (13) Single phase 25 Kva Pad mounts and
(7) Single phase 15 Kva Pad méunts listed in this bid for 2 total purchase ptice of §_52,650.00

this s FOB, 502 B. 12 Street, Beloit, Kansas £7470-0567.

[ understand that this bid is to be gatanteed for no less thag fifieen (15) days From the date
of bid opening, : '
Bﬁ)bgi{ (NAME Qp BIRM) - Solomon Corporation

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE, oot y

 ADDRESS 103 W Main Street crry Solomon
STATE Kansas ! ZIP CODE 67480
TELRPHONE 800-234-2867, ext 193 DATE _7-25-14
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PROPOSAL SHEET
FORBID 1L -032714

Tpropose to supply the City of Beloit, Kansas with (13) Single phase 25 Kva Pad mounts and
0
(7) Single phase 15 Kva Pad mouns listed in this bid for a total puschase price of § 54, 077 ©

this is FOB, 502 E. 12™ Street, Beloit, Kansas 67420-0567.

Lunderstand that this bid is to be guarantead for no less than fifteen (15) days from the date

of bid opening,

smoer gusne or ey [ ) ESCO

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURT, Wu 777&2,._/

ADDRESS 220\ Eogt Teutencriy_ Lonsas City
starm )0 5 __zipcope_ (AR 7

TELEPHONE G 1o - 44 9-9239  pate 7/5//’%
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REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION:

I recommend that the city council approve the bid from Boettcher Supply in the amount of
$5,720.00. Funding is available under Electric Systems Division, 53-43-8300.

FISCAL NOTE:
Boettcher Supply - $5,720.00
Kriz-Davis Co. $5,350.00
Stanion Wholesale Eleciric $6,747.72
BISCUSSION:

The materials will be used for the Beloit Elementary School and Circle Drive projects.
Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION - 8/5/14







502 East 12 Street
Beloit, Kansas 67420

Tel No (785) 738-3781
Fax No (785) 738-2290

TO: City Administrator and City Council

FROM: Ronald Sporleder
Director of System Operations

RE: Conduit Bid
DATE: July 30, 2014
Glenn and City Council,

1 am recommending we approve Boettcher Supply conduit bid for $5,720. This
will help get the grade school and Cirele drive ready. The bid is within 10% of the lowest
bid so I went with the local business.

The bid will be coming out of 53-43-8300 fund.

Boetter Supply $5,720
Kriz-Davis §5,350
Stanion $6,747.72

Ronald Sporleder
Director of Systems Operation



CITY OF BELOIT
119 North Hersey
Box 567
Beloit, Kansas 67420

The City of Beloit, Kansas, 119 North Hersey, Box 567, Beloit, Kansas, will be
accepting bids at the office of the City Clerks until:

TIME: 3:30 PM

DATE: July 30, 2014

* For the purchase of thefollowmg item(s)/ rﬁaféﬁal(s): Conduit Bid L-032717
All items(s)/ matetial(s) are to be bid FOB, Beloit, Kansas. This bid s to be
guaranteed for no less than thirty (30) days from the date of bid opening,

All bids submitted in an envelope ate to be prominently marked: Conduit or L-
032717
All bids submitted by fax or email will need to have a follow up signed
bid in an envelope and is to be prominently marked:
Conduit or L-032717

All bids received by the closing date and time will be publicly opened and read
aloud at the time and date above in the office of the City Clerk, 119 North Hersey,
Beloit, Kansas.

All bids must fill out the spec sheet attached or bid will be denied

The City of Beloit, reserves the right to select the best bid, waiver formalities
and reject any and all bxds.

For additional information on bid specifications, contact Ronnte Sporleder at
System Operations Department, (785) 738-3731.

For additional information on results of the bid opening, contact the Office of

the City Clerk, (785) 738-3551 o0
Mandy Lomax 7 d' ﬁ(f (2 D aul' s ‘5)3 SIO o
) ; : o
Director of Finance / City C> &6% %Cj?ﬁm 55%0}/ . 5,)7 20 P
are within 10% , § Lovest é’tj

Page 1 of 2
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BOETTCHER SUPPLY, INC. Quotation
118 W. Court, PO Box 486 ‘

Beloit, Kansas 67420-0486

785-738-5781 ox 800-657-5770

JOB NAME | Conduit - L-032717 PAGE_ 1
PRICED BY | Blake Miller DATE | 7/28/24
SALESMAN QUOTE # | 117-72814-1
TO:  City of Beloit __ TERMS | Net 30
119 N Hersey, PO Box 567 FOB | Beloit, KS

Beloit, KS 67420

QTy U7 ITEW DESCRIPTION PRICE | EXTENSION
1000 | FT_ |BG3405P-020 | 3" Bore-GardSCH40x20° " | 335| ' 3350.00

100 | FT_ |BG440SP-020 | 4" Bore: Gard SCH 40 x 20" 3.90 390.00
1200 |, FT_ |49015-010_ . | 4" SCH4O'NM Conduitx10'  ~  |"° ~ '1.65] . 1880.00

TOTAL|  $5,720.00

All itemns ordered will be subject to freight charges, unless noted otherwise,

Please refer to the quote number above when ordering.



) > -
\ Kriz-Davis Co. Quotation
WHoﬁﬁﬁﬁniLEﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁfupﬂ’Es EXPIRATION DATE QUOTE NUMBER
% %2]_ ﬂl\[ IHII(RSDSMM - 08/27/2014 5100203009
Fax 785-827-8166 SR, IS 8
Fax 785-827-8166 1of1
QUOTE TO- SHIP TO:
CITY OF BELOIT CITY OF BELOIT
PO BOX 587 : 502 E12TH 8T
BELOQIT, KS 67420-0567 BELOIT, KS 67420-1409
CUSTOMER NUMBER CUSTOMER PO NUMBER JOB NAME / RELEASE NUMBER | REQUIRED DATE
8520 07/28/2014
ENTERED BY SHIP VIA FREIGHT ALLOWED
LUKE RACETTE ' BIG TRUCK WED No
ORDER QTY ) ' DESCRIPTION . ' UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE
1000c | PVC BG3405P-020 ' 311.000/c 3110.00
3" BORE-GUARD SCH40
20FT LENGTHS
100it | PVC BG4403P-020 332.000/C 332.00
4 |N BORE-GARD SCH 40 20FT

1200t | PVC SCH404 159.000/c | 1908.00
4 PVC SCHEDULE 40 '

=R Unless otherwise noted gquotes expire in 30 dayg™ =
=% Sales Tax, Freight, and Misc llems may not be included == Subtotzl 5350.00
No returns without prior approval. All returns must be accompanied S&H Charges 0.00
by a copy of the invoice and are subject to a restocking charge. 9 :
No returns allowed on non-stocked items or cut wire.

Amount Due 5350.00

Printzd By: LRACETT on 7/28/2014 12:50:34 PM



The City of Beloit needs
o  1000ft of 3 inch bore guard conduit
e 100ft of 4 inch bore guard conduit

s 1200ft of dinch of schedule 40 conduit

BG3405P-020; $3.11/FOOT

BG4405P-020: $3.32/FOOT

PVC SHCEDULE 4047 $1.59/FOOT

There would also be a $276.87 freight charge to ship this matetial from the factory in
Oklahoma City, OK to Beloit, KS.

From:___ Kuz-Davis Company.

: 232 N. 3% &,

Salina, KS 67401

Authorized Signatiie—ssormssm® /‘\\—a:}_g

N




1206 E 22ND ST QUOTE

-

Oiuats Nber

HAYS KS67601-0834 Lo
S BWHOLFSALE Phone No: 785-628-8722 3685235-00
Website: www.stanion.com Fax No: 785-628-8320
1 CONDUIT QUOTE
Bill To: Ship To:
CITY OF BELOIT CITY OF BELOIT
502 E 12TH ST
PO BOX 567
BELOIT, KS 67420-0567 BELOIT, KS 67420
eevice Center: HAYS, K8 Phy 783-628-8722
5 INSTRUCTIONS -+ ».» -<9. . PLACEDHY.-~ 1 + TAKENBY |- = " SHIPVIA .7~ - | REQUESTED - " TERMS
Ronnie S. Lhw QUR TRUCK Q7128414 Passalng
e I P R PR ‘Quiantity : -~} - Quantity .3 . Quantity VT R -Atnount
- ~ and D T
No. .- Produgt dnd Description Orderad © | Swipped <. oo, ¢ ] UM - UPE b ey
1 __BG:HGSI.’QZQCA_R_;’-;'-_'A-_M'-,f.:;‘:3:3__'._“_’ IR 00 ., v 400 S Co 44523100 .. 445,13
13 20- FT BORE-GARD o oy S o
2 1200 159.50000 . . 1,914.00
3 {000 JHE000 - - "o 38R0,
3 "uQ':ly Shipped Towl : al
15es
Inyoice Toml
hown sre based on
rices quosed are bas_:a_d.
d. Prices are ﬂrm;
stdinifirs] be-renegotiased afier that me
Last Page This Quotation is subject 10 onr General Terms snd Conditons of Business Transeciions, (which can be found at

www.stamion.comfierms. himl) which are incorporated by reference lierein as shough fully set forih.



JOB HAME | Conduit - L-032717 PAGE 1
SRIGED &Y | Blake Miller  DATE | 7/28/24
SALESWAN QUOTE # | 117-72814-1
T City of Beloit TERWS | Net 30
119 N Hersey, PO Box 567 FOB | Beloit, KS
Beloit, KS 67420
OTY Ui (TEM | DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION
1000 ST |BG340SP-020 | 3" Bore-Gard SCH 40 % 20' | 335] 3350.00
100 FT  |BGA440SP-020 | 4" Bore_Gard SCH 40 x 20' 3.90 390.00
1200 | FT  |49015-010 4" SCH 40 NM Conduit % 10° 1.65 1980.00

$5,720.00

=}
= |-
)

Al Hems orderad will be subject io feeighi charges, unless noted otherwiss,

Fleasa refar to the guote number above whan ordering.






REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION: .

I recommend that the city council approve the bid from Kriz-Davis Electric Company in the
amount of $6,700.00. Funding is available under Electric Systems Division, 53-43-8300.

FISCAL NOTE:
Kriz-Davis Co. $6,700.00
Stanion Wholesale Electric $7,050.40
Boettcher Supply $5.,975.00
DISCUSSION:

The materials wilt be used for Beloit Elementary School and Circle Drive projects,
Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION.






502 East 12% Street
Beloit, Kansas 67420

Tel No (785) 738-3781
Fax No (785) 738-2290

TO: City Administrator and City Council

FROM: Ronald Sporleder
Director of System Operations

RE: Nordic 350 Bid
DATE: July 31,2014
Glenn and City Council,

I am recommending we approve the Kriz-Davis Nordic 350 bid for $6,700. This
will help us with our correct projects. Boeticher Supply did not meet our specs. This will
be coming out of 53-53-8300 fimd.

Kriz-Davis $6,700
Stanion Whole Sale $7,050.40
Boettcher Supply $5,975

Ronald Sporleder
Director of Systems Operation



CITY OF BELOIT
119 North Hersey
Box 567
Beloit, Kansas 67420

The City of Beloit, Kansas, 119 North Hersey, Box 567, Beloit, Kansas, will be
accepting bids at the office of the City Clerks until:

TIME: 3:30 PM

DATE: July 30, 2014

For the purchase of the following item(s)/ material(s): Nordic Bid L-032718
All items(s)/ material(s) are to be bid FOB, Beloit, Kansas. This bid 1s to be
guaranteed for no less than thirty (30) days from the date of bid opening.

All bids submitted in an envelope are to be prominently marked: Conduit or L-
032718 ‘ ”
All bids submitted by fax or email will need to have a follow up signed
bid in an envelope and is to be prominently marked:
Nordic Bid or L-032718

All bids received by the closing date and time will be publicly opened and read
aloud at the time and date above in the office of the City Clerk, 119 North Hersey,
Beloit, Kansas.

All bids must fill out the spec sheet attached or bid will be denied

The City of Beloit, reserves the right to select the best bid, waiver formalities
and reject any and all bids.

For additional information on bid specifications, contact Ronnie Sporleder at
System Operations Department, (785) 738-3781.

For additional information on results of the bid opening, contact the Office of
the City Clerk, (785) 738-3551 |

Director of Finance / City Clerk AL W&ﬂ whdkf@/{ 20 co¥e

Ruztiche Sppl, 57 75’ 22
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o

232 N THIRD

SALINA, KS 67401-2322
785-827-4497

Fax 785-827-8166

QUOTE TO:

CITY OF BELOIT

PO BOX 567

BELOIT, KS 67420-0567

WHOLESALE ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

“An Binpinyer (hwied Compeary™

01 BRI | BEIEEARARARE )2 )1 00 BN
Quotation

Kriz-Davis Co,

EXPIRATION DATE QUOTE NUMBER
08/2712014 S100803003

232 N THIRD PAGE NO.

SALINA, KS 67401-2322

785-827-4497

Fax 785-827-8168 1o0f1

SHIP TO:

CITY OF BELOIT

502 E12TH ST

BELOIT, KS 67420-1409

CUSTOMER NUMBER CUSTOMER PO NUMBER JOB NAME / RELEASE NUMBER REQUIRED DATE
6520 07/28/2014
‘ENTERED BY SHIP VIA FREIGHT ALLOWED
LUKE RACETTE BIG_TRUCK WED No
ORDERATY | | DESCRIFTION ] UNIT PRICE EXTPRICE
Bga | NORDIC ND-350-MG-101-3152-W3A 1340.000/ea 6700.00
NORDIC 3 PHASE SECTIONALIZING
CABINET AND BASE WITH 3 POINT 15KV
200 AMP LOAD BREAK JUNCTION AND
PARKING STANDS INSTALLED
=R Unless otherwise noted guotes expire in 30 days™ = <w=
¥ Sales Tax, Freight, and l\/‘liscI ttems may not be included **** Subtotal 6700.00
No returns without prior approval. All returns must be accompanied
by a copy of the invoice and are subject to a restocking charge. S&H Charges 0.00
No returns allowed cn non-stocked items or cut wire,
Amount Dua 6700.00

Printed By: LRACETT on 7/28/2074 12:41:03 PM




The City of Beloit needs
e 5 eaNordic 350
o ND 350 —MG—101~3152—W3A
Total Bid Prce:_$6,700.00__
Lead Time:__7-8 Weeks from Factory After Receipt of Order___
e TFrom Knz-Davis Company

e 232N. 3" St, Salina, KS 67401

s Authorized Sigﬁatu& IR s G o a——

~N



1206 E 22ND ST

HAYS K567601-0834
Phone No:  785-628-8732
Fax No: 783-628-8320

HOLESALE ERECIRICTD.

i miccstriom cam

Website: www._stanion.com

Mordic Quaote
Bill Ta: Ship To:
CITY OF BELOIT CITY OF BELOIT
' 502 E 1I2TH ST
PO BOX 567
BELOIT, KS 67420-0567 BELOIT, K§ 67420
Service Center: HAYS, KS Ph: 785-628-8722
- T INSTRUCTIONS © + - = -2 .. *-PLACED BY:" -] »"TAKENBY |- v iSHIPVIA: o= -} REQUESTED | ~ * - TERMS
rommie bhw DIRECT SHIP §7/29714 Passaing
Tine | e e e ol Quaindty T - Quantity. 5 Quantity L gy NIRRT
‘Mo, | .. iProductdnd Deseripton, -3 T diecg : |- Shipped - Pt 7B, - Pree i (Net)
| ND3SOMGICI3} g EE - 1303.82000 . .- G.519.18
1 er Shipped Tail

woice Toai

shown are based on
Prices quoted gre bustd o
fiated. Prices are firm
encgotiated after tha

L

Fast Page This Quotation is sabject to ouc General Terms rnd Canditons of Business Transactions, (witich cin be found 5t
www.stanioh.comiterms. istmb) witich are incorporated by reference herein as shough flly set forth.




BOETTCHER SUPPLY, INC.
18 W. Court, PO Box 486

Beloit, Kansas 67420-0486

785-738-5781 or 800-657-5770

JOB NAME | Nordic Bid L-032718
PRICED BY | Blake Miller
SALESMAN
TO: City of Beloit
119 N Hersey, PO Box 567
Beloit, KS 67420
Q7Y U/M ITEM DESCRIPTION
5 EA |FSC5553DGIXXXB|MP HIGHLINE - 3-PH. F[bergiass Primary Cabln t

55"L x 53"H, DirectBurial, w/fully adjustab!e
5.5, Dal‘klngstands mounted above,

Alternate to. Nordlc ND:= 350 MG- 101-)( X.:

Lo b enbs Dilivery )

W/galvanlzed rails & plate & copper gmund ba ‘_

[ Quotation

1

7/29/14
117-72914-1

Net 30

| TERWS |
Beloit, KS

ER{ClE _| EXTENSION
'1195.00 5975.00

TOTAL

$5,975.00)

All items ordared will be subject fo freight charges, unless noted Otherw-
ise,

Please refer to the quote number above when ordering.



55.c0

53.00

%m___ e S —
5
=

2100

_ f 60,00 “
_ 68.00 |

51.00

36.00
o 43.00

%" GROUNDBAR

DIM +/- ¥4"

The information contained in this drawing is the sole
property of Highline Products. Any reproduction in part
or whole without the written permission of Highline
Products is prohibited

FSCS5553DGJXXXB

L BEECHER

16/05/2010

9151-3569

*







REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION:

I recommend that the city council approve the bid from Larson Construction in the amount of
$26,950.00. Funding is available under Electric Systerns Division, 53-43-8300,

FESCAL NOTE:
Larson Construction $26,950.00
Dig-It Underground LLC No Bid
Ziegler’s No Bid
BISCUSSION:

The materials will be used for Beloit Elementary School and Circle Drive projects.

Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Redden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION -






502 East 12 Street
Beloit, Kansas 67420

Tel No (785) 738-3781
Fax No (785) 738-2290

TO: City Administrator and City Council

FROM: Ronald Sporleder
Director of System Operations

RE: Boring Bid
DATE: July 30,2014
Glenn and City Council,

I am recommending we approve the Larson boring bid of $26,950.00, for the
Grade school and Circle drive project. We sent the bid out to Dig It Underground and
Ziegler’s. Larson is the only bidder that said they can do the boring.

This will come out of the 53-43-8300 fund.

Larson $26,950
Dig It- No Bid
Ziegler’s- No Bid

Ronald Sporieder
Director of Systems Operation



e,

CITY OF BELOIT

119 North Hersey
_ Box 567
Beloit, Kansas 67420

The City of Beloit, Kansas, 119 North Hersey, Box 567, Beloit, Kansas, will be
accepting bids at the office of the City Clerks until:

TIME: 3:30 PM

DATE: July 30, 2014

" For the puichase of the following item(s)/ matetial(s): Boting and Trencher Bid L-032716
All items(s)/ matetial(s) ate to be bid FOB, Beloit, Kansas. This bid is to be
guaranteed for no less than thirty (30) days from the date of bid opening.

All bids submitted in an envelope are to be prominently marked: Boring and
trencher Bid or L-032716
All bids submitted by fax or email will need to have a follow up signed
bid in an envelope and is to be prominently marked:
Boring and trencher Bid ot L-032716

All bids received by the closing date and time will be publicly opened and read
aloud at the time and date above in the office of the City Clerk, 119 North Heisey,
Beloit, Kansas.

All bids must fill out the spec sheet atiached or bid will be denied

The City of Beloit, reserves the right to select the best bid, waiver formalities -
and reject any and all bids.

For additional information on bid specifications, contact Ronnie Sporleder at
System Operations Department, (785) 738-3781. '

For additional information on results of the bid opening, contact the Office of

the City Clerk, (785) 738-3551 oo

) arson Constovction 26 7505
Mandy Lomax
Director of Finance / City Cletk i | C/




9192 S. Manhattan Ave.

P.O. Box 1411

- Manhattan, KS 66505-1411
{785) 537-0160

? bob@larcoine.biz

LARSON CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Proposal

Nt_i;nbef:

E2001

‘Date:

712512014

Beloit , KS, 67420

To: . - Job Address:
City of Beloit Boring and Trencher Bid
119 N. Hersey L-032716

PO Number Terms Project
Daté ... |Description . T e ’ngnUHr'sli Unif I Fra'_éé/Rate|_ St/ca ,r'axl City Ta:'r' - Amourit
Bore for 3" conduit furnished by City - :
includes spotting of existing utilites 100000  ft $18.50 $18.500.00
dig underfinto existing transformers 400 ea. $275.00 $1,100.00
Grade School
trench with compacted backdiil 48" and
install conduit furnished by Gity 100000 # $4.50 $4,500.00
set boxes furnished by City 400 ea $250.00 $1,000.00
bore for conduit furnished by City 10000 $18.50 $1,850.00
NOQ Rocl Removal - trenching or boring SubTotal $26,950.00
NO reseeding or landscapin -
NO pormits of feoa T State/County Tax 7.30% on $0.00 $0.00
NO material of any kind - pipe; fittings; bedding City Tax 1.25% on $0.00 $0.00
All stalking of easements or routing by Others
. TOTAL DUE $26,950.00




leloitsystems@nckcn.com

i S
rom: digitunderground@gmail.com
ent: Wednesday, July 30, 2014 9:55 AM
o: beloitsystems@ncken.com
ubject: City of Beloit Bid
iity Of Beloit

‘hank you for the opportunity to bid on the grade school and Circle drive underground project, Due to the deadline
ind our current work load we will not bid this project. Thanks again and we look forward to working with you in the

uture.
Yig-It Underground LLC
‘hris Wagner

ake Baxa

ent from Windows Mail



REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

RECOMMENDATION:

1 recommend that the city council approve the hid from Sidener Environmental Services in the
amount of $14,803.00. Funding is available under Water Plant Division, 51-41-7490.

FISCAL NOTE:

Sidener Environmental Sexrvices $14,803.00
Hach Company $18,426.54

DISCUSSION:

The current turbidity network needs to be upgraded and is used to measure water clarity.

Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL ACTION TURBIDITY NETWORK







To: Mayor, Council and Administrator
From: James Bentz (Director of Water/Wastewater Operations)

Subject: Turbidity Network Bids for Water Plant

Due to the age and failing status of our current Turbidity network, we
are forced to upgrade to a new Turbidity Network (turbidity is a
measurement of water clarity). Our current system was installed in
2002 and can not be upgraded. Federal and State Regulations require
that we have continuous turbidity monitoring and data saving.

| received 2 (two) bids for the complete network, that will be installed
in-house.

Sidener Environmental Services (Siemans Turbidimeter) $14803.00
Hach Company (Hach Turbidimeter) $18426.54

Due to a clerical error, Sidener’s bid omitted 1 process meter. That is
why the cost difference from bid sheet. But they did include a service
call for set up that will probably not be needed.

After review of the bids and equipment. Due io the ease of installation
and cost, | would like to recommend purchasing the Sieman
Turbidimeters and network equipment from Sidener Environmental
Services at a cost of $14803.00

$20,000.00 was budgeted for this purchase in 51-41-7490.






City of Beloit Bid Sheet
Bids Must Be Submitted On This Sheet

¥ propose to perform the services and provide the materials according to the specifications:

All item(s)/material(s) are to be bid F.O.B., Beloit, Ks.

This bid is guaranteed for no less than thirty (30) days from the date of the bid opening.

Bid Amount: $18426.54
Submitted By: fﬁq;;»aww Ldbm

Printed Name: Roxanna Nittmann

Company Name:  Hach Company

Date:  7/25/2014

¢ Please reference attached Hach quotation #100026783 for more detail.
e Optional pricing for service and Ice Pic provided within the Hach quotation







Be Right™

Quote Date: 24-ul-2014

City of Beloit KS

Mame: Amanda Lomax
Phone; 7857383551
Fax: 7857383551

Quote Expiration: 22-Sep-2014

Customer Quote Refergnce: Turbidity Monitoring Network

Sales Contact: Kevin Plowman  Email: kplowman@hach.com Phone: 785-766-1192

Bid

Hach Company

PO Box 608

Loveland, CO 8053390608
Phone; {800} 227-4224
Email: guctes@hach.com
Website:  www.hach.com

Quote Number: 100026783v2
Use quote riumber st time of srder to ensurae
that you receiva prices quated

1XV404.99.01542

5200 CONTR, AC-DC, DiG, 4-20mA IN, MOD,HACH

1,877.42

1 3 5,632.26)
2 1 Xv404.99.01552 5200 COMTROLLER, AC-DC,2DIG, MOD, HACH 2 1,814.42 3,628.84
3 6010101 1720E TURBIDIMETER, SENSOR ASSEMBLY 5 1,239.84] £,199.20
4 5796000 Digitzl Extension Cable, 7.7m {25t} 4 137.76 551.04
5 9202900 KIiT, POWER CORD, 5c200 NORTH AMERICA ACCESSORIES 5 43.72 218.60
B 'Ws-UDG UDGI000™ {Univeral Data Gateway) Software i 1,302.00 1,302.00
7 5920400 KIT, CONVERTER, RS485/422 TO USB i 654.36 £54.36
Formazin Calibration Kit for 2720C and 17200/€ Turbldimeter (includaes
8 4415600 Calibration Cylinder, TenSette Pipet, 500 mL 4{300 NTU formazgn) 1 240.24 24024

OPFTIONAL SERVICE

1 59P ** Field Sve FULL DAY StartUp-PROCESS (P} 1 1,869.00 1,865.00
2 STARTUP TRAVEL “* Fiald Svc HACH START UP TRAVEL CHG 1 187.00 187.00
3 59P **Additional optional Field Suc FULE DAY . 1 1,869.00 1,868.00
4 STARTUP TRAVEL ** Fiald Svc HACH START UP TRAVEL CHG i 187.00 187.00
Optional Secondary [ce Pic

[CE-PIC Calibration Module, 20 NTU, for 1720C,1720D,and 1720E Process

5 5225000 Turbidimeter 1 632.00 530.88

Page t of 2







City of Beloit Bid Sheet
Bids Must Be Submitted On This Sheet

I propose to pérform the services and provide the materials according to the specifications:

All tem(s)/material(s) axe to be bid F.O.B., Beloit, Ks.

This bid is guaranteed for no less than thirty (30) days from the date of the bid opening.

pid amownt:_ % |4 7. SO / A 1420300
Submi’cted By: Mr‘t@f_ ﬂgﬁ;bkm\{

Printed Name: E‘U({“Q/ % L,,_.,&l_g e

Compeny Nagwe: _Stdepser Epus S\Q.fw*cé
Date: ‘va;’ E) l_/ ‘f ?[

L{Pdaj&ﬁ d&Q Teo @Ie.rfaaje.fpg&







QUQOTE Invoice #

]
o v

-~

=
Ce

Sidener Environmenial Services
1829 Borman Circle Drive
St. Lonis, MO 63146-1068
Phone:860-528-2887/314-991-0730
Fax:314-991-3527

g
|
3 2

[
e

Bill Te: CITY OF BELOIT ShipTe: CITY OF BELOIT
WATER PLANT WATER PLANT
ATTN: JAMES BENTZ ATTN: JAMES BENTZ
215 S. CHESTNUT 215 8. CHESTNUT
BELOIT KS 67420 _ BELOITKS 67420

Nalesperso
3123 SERVICE NET 30 SIDENER TRUCK
KS

e gesien QUOTATION sk

16 IHrs LBR-SHN-O _ 85.000 1,360.00
LABOR CHARGE FOR EQUIPMENT
LISTED BELOW: SET UP AND TRAIN
ON WEBALERT SYSTEM
OPTIONAL SERVICE

490 MIL MILEAGE 0.850 416.50
MILEAGE FOR SERVICE CALL
OPTIONAL

5 EA TMS36I1CW 1685.000 9.925.00
TURBIDIMETER AAC5723 WHITE
LIGHT AUTOMATIC ULTRASONIC CLN
4-20 MA OUTPUT 0-100 NTU

1 EA WAS00-PNN 1356.000 1,356.00
WEBALERT SERIES PROCESS
MONITOR 120V USB/ETHERNET
STANDARD

2 EA PD6060-6RO 628.500 1,257.00
PD6060-6RO PROVU DUAL INPUT
PROCESS METER

1 EA PDA2812 238.500 238.50
(ContinvedonPage 2 )
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Bilk To:

-
™ B
ey £

.
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v

-
Tk
s

A

mwj

S
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CITY OF BELOIT

WATER PLANT
ATTN: JAMES BENTZ

215 8. CHESTNUT
BELOIT XS 67420

QUOTE

Fax:314-991-3527

Ship Te:

VOICcE:

Invoice #

Sidener Environmertal Services
1825 Borman Circle Drive
St. Louis, MO 63146-1068
Phone:800-528-2887/314-991-0730

CITY OF BELOIT
WATER PLANT
ATTN: JAMES BENTZ
215 S. CHESTNUT
BELOIT KS 67420

Salesperso

07/31/14

65452
11/19/13

SERVICE

NET 30

SIDENER TRUCK
KS

wEwAckr GUOTATION

(Page 2

Fokgk

PDA2812 PLASTIC NEMA 4X
ENCLOSURE FOR TWO METERS

PDA1011

PDA1011 EXPANSION MODULE FOR
TWO 4-20mA OUT PUTS ON THE

PDO060-6RO

Subtotal

LODGING FOR SERVICE CALL
MEALS ON SERVICE CALL

Quote Total

VISIT US AT WWW.SIDENER.NET

0.000 .00

14,553.00
150.00
100.00

14,803.00
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ITEMS FOR COUNCIL DISCUSSION

DISCUSSION:

Items for discussion at your August 5, 2014 Work Session will include the following:

A. Water Supply. City Engineer Stuart Porter will introduce John Brummer from Trekk
Design Group at our next council meeting to discuss our options for our water treatment

facility. Doug McKinney from Regional Planning will also be present to speak about
funding alternatives for this project.

Respectfully submitted,

Glenn Rodden
City Administrator

COUNCIL DISCUSSION







